
cosmotek college - 2022 Annual Report 
Summary 
Institution Data: 

1. Report Year: 2022 

2. Institution Code: 21939625 

3. Institution Name: cosmotek college 

4. Street Address (Physical Location): 2188-B Del Franco street 

5. City: San Jose 

6. State: CA 

7. Zip Code: 95131 

8. Form of business organization of this institution: N/A 

9. Number of Branch Locations: 0 

10. Number of Satellite Locations: 0 

11a. Is this institution current with all assessments to the Student Tuition Recovery 
Fund? Yes 

11b. Is this institution current on Annual Fees?: Yes 

12. Is your institution accredited by an accrediting agency/agencies recognized by the 
United States Department of Education? No 

13. If your institution has specialized accreditation from a recognized United States 
Department of Education approved specialized/programmatic accreditor? N/A 

14. Has any accreditation agency taken any final disciplinary action against this 
institution in the reporting year? No 

15. Does your institution participate in federal financial aid programs under Title IV of 
the Federal Higher Education Act? (This includes federal loans and grants) No 

16. Does your institution participate in veterans' financial aid education programs? No 

17. Does your institution participate in the Cal Grant program? No 

18. Is your institution on California`s Eligible Training Provider List (ETPL)? Yes 



19. Is your institution receiving funds from the Work Innovation and Opportunity Act 
(WIOA) Program? Yes 

20. Does your Institution participate in, or offer, any other state or federal government 
financial aid programs? (i.e., vocational rehab…) Yes 

20a. You indicated "Yes" for #20, please provide the name of the financial aid 
program below: vocational rehab 

21. Provide the percentage of institutional income during this Reporting Year that was 
derived from public funding: 8 

22. Does your Institution participate in, or offer any non-government financial aid 
programs? (i.e., private grants/loans, institutional grants/loans): No 

23. The percentage of institutional income in the reporting year that was derived from 
any non-government financial aid: 0 

24. Enter the most recent three-year cohort default rate reported by the U.S. 
Department of Education for this institution, if applicable: 0 

25. Provide the percentage of the students who attended this institution during this 
Reporting Year who received federal student loans to help pay their cost of education at 
the school: 0 

27. Total number of students currently enrolled at this institution. Indicate the number 
of students attending and/or enrolled in all programs at your institution (minus the 
number of students who cancelled during the cancellation period) January 1st through 
December 31st: 299 

28. Number of Doctorate Degree Programs Offered? Indicate the number of Doctorate 
degree Programs the institution offered for the reporting year. (Number of Programs 
not Students): 0 

29. Number of Students enrolled in Doctorate programs at this institution? Indicate the 
number of students enrolled and/or active in all Doctorate programs at your institution 
as of January 1st through December 31st, minus the number of students who cancelled 
during the cancellation period: 0 

30. Number of Master Degree Programs Offered? Indicate the number of Master degree 
Programs the institution offered for the reporting year. (Number of Programs not 
Students): 0 

31. Number of Students enrolled in Master programs at this institution? Indicate the 
number of students enrolled and/or active in all Master programs at your institution as 
of January 1st through December 31st, minus the number of students who cancelled 
during the cancellation period: 0 



32. Number of Bachelor Degree Programs Offered? Indicate the number of Bachelor 
degree Programs the institution offered for the reporting year. (Number of Programs 
not Students): 0 

33. Number of Students enrolled in Bachelor programs at this institution? Indicate the 
number of students enrolled and/or active in all Bachelor programs at your institution as 
of January 1st through December 31st, minus the number of students who cancelled 
during the cancellation period: 0 

34. Number of Associate Degree Programs Offered? Indicate the number of Associate 
degree Programs offered for the reporting year. (Number of Programs not Students) 
: N/A 

35. Number of Students enrolled in Associate programs at this institution? Indicate the 
number of students enrolled and/or active in all Associate programs at your institution 
as of January 1st through December 31st, minus the number of students who cancelled 
during the cancellation period: 0 

36. Number of Diploma or Certificate Programs Offered? Indicate the number of Diploma 
or Certificate Programs offered for the reporting year. (Number of Programs not 
Students): 19 

37. Number of Students enrolled in diploma or certificate programs at this institution? 
Indicate the number of students enrolled and/or active in all diploma/certificate 
programs at your institution as of January 1st through December 31st, minus the 
number of students who cancelled during the cancellation period: 299 

Institution's Website: N/A 
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